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Syarifa Wahidah <idahsya76@gmail.com>

Fwd: NR: Acceptance Letter for Paper ID: 2000915 
2 pesan

Aliefman Hakim <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 2 Maret 2021 15.17
Kepada: wahidah sy <idahsya76@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
Dari: <nr@scirp.org> 
Date: Sen, 7 Okt 2019 16.02 
Subject: NR: Acceptance Letter for Paper ID: 2000915 
To: <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 

Dear Dr. Aliefman Hakim,  

Greetings from Natural Resources. 

This is to inform you that your paper entitled "Characteristic of Active Compound of Artocarpus odoratissimus" has been accepted
for publication. 

This manuscript will be ready for publication if the following three procedures can be completed within a week: 

Step 1: Complete the Copyright Transfer 

Step 2: Make Payment for Article Processing Charge $200. (The payment information shown in your user center is the only correct
and certified information; please do not be misled by other uncertified payment notification.) 

Step 3: Revise the paper according to the comments on the system and Format it in our template, and Upload revised version in
Word format through the system. Please highlight the revisions in red color in the updated version and send us a response letter on
the comments if available. (The template and review comments are available on the system. Please send the reformatted file via
email if the size of it is more than 4MB.) 

Please login to the online system with your account and password to view all the information. 

Please feel free to contact us if you have any question.

Best regards,  

Editorial Assistant 
Anita LIU 
NR Editorial Office

Aliefman Hakim <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 2 Maret 2021 15.18
Kepada: wahidah sy <idahsya76@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
Dari: nr <nr@scirp.org> 
Date: Jum, 18 Okt 2019 10.31 
Subject: RE: NR: Acceptance Letter for Paper ID: 2000915 
To: Aliefman Hakim <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 

Dear Dr. Aliefman Hakim,   

mailto:nr@scirp.org
mailto:aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com
mailto:nr@scirp.org
mailto:aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com


3/2/2021 Gmail - Fwd: NR: Acceptance Letter for Paper ID: 2000915

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=9b496777a6&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1693103674767350962&simpl=msg-f%3A16931036747… 2/4

Kindly be informed that your paper 2000915 has been scheduled into the current issue of NR in
October 2019. 

When the typeset proof is ready, we will get back to you at the earliest time. 

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

Best Regards,

Anita LIU

NR Managing Editor

Quick Submission Online

Official Mail: nr@scirp.org

Alternative: mengzhu-liu@hotmail.com; Anita_liu0914@hotmail.com

Skype/LinkedIn/Facebook

QQ: 2453582947 / WeChat: Smile17343210457

From: Aliefman Hakim <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, October 18, 2019 9:52 
To: nr 
Subject: Re: NR: Acceptance Le�er for Paper ID: 2000915
 
Dear Anita LIU 

is there any information when the certainty of my article will be published in NR? Thank you 

Sincerely 
Aliefman Hakim 

Pada tanggal Rab, 16 Okt 2019 10.26, nr <nr@scirp.org> menulis: 

Dear Dr. Aliefman Hakim,    

 

OK, we will check the account and inform you at the earliest time upon receiving your payment. 
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After confirmation, we will make arrangement for your revised paper soon. 

 

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.

 

Best Regards, 

Anita LIU

NR Managing Editor

Quick Submission Online

Official Mail: nr@scirp.org

Alternative: mengzhu-liu@hotmail.com; Anita_liu0914@hotmail.com

Skype/LinkedIn/Facebook

QQ: 2453582947 / WeChat: Smile17343210457

From: Aliefman Hakim <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 16, 2019 9:47 
To: nr 
Subject: Re: NR: Acceptance Le�er for Paper ID: 2000915
 
Dear Anita LIU  
 
Fist of all we thanks that my article accepted in NR.  
Softcopy Article, copyright, and proof of publication fee in attached file. thank you
 
sincerely
Aliefman Hakim 
 
 
 
 
Pada tanggal Sen, 14 Okt 2019 pukul 08.48 nr <nr@scirp.org> menulis: 

Dear Dr. Aliefman Hakim,   

 

OK, the copyright form for paper 2000915 together with the payment notice & comments to
this mail, please check it. 

 

Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions.
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Best Regards,

Anita LIU

NR Managing Editor

Quick Submission Online

Official Mail: nr@scirp.org

Alternative: mengzhu-liu@hotmail.com; Anita_liu0914@hotmail.com

Skype/LinkedIn/Facebook

QQ: 2453582947 / WeChat: Smile17343210457

From: Aliefman Hakim <aliefmanhakim27@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 14, 2019 8:21 
To: nr 
Subject: Re: NR: Acceptance Le�er for Paper ID: 2000915
 
Dear Anita LIU 
 
Thank you for the accepted of my article. 
 
Could you sent my the procedure for pay the publication fee, the copyrigt transfer, and the revise paper? 
 
I will do the payment of the publication fee tomorrow. 
 
Sencerely
 
Aliefman Hakim 
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
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