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Acknowledgement (Ekstemnal ¢
Kotak Masuk

Editor 14/5/2021

7

kepada saya v

Nuriadi Nuriadi:

Thank you for submitting the manuscript, "AN
ALTERNATIVE METHOD OF TEACHING CREATIVE
LITERARY WRITING: A CASE STUDY OF EFL
LEARNERS AT INDONESIAN UNIVERSITY" to PalArch's
Journal of Archaeology of Egypt / Egyptology. With
the online journal management system that we are
using, you will be able to track its progress through
the editorial process by logging in to the journal web
site:

Submission URL: https://archives.palarch.nl/
index.php/jae/authorDashboard/submission/8317
Username: nuriadi

If you have any questions, please contact me. Thank
you for considering this journal as a venue for your
work.

Editor
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[JAE] Password Reset

Kotak Masuk

Nuriadi Nuriadi 14/5/2021
€
kepada saya v

Your password has been successfully reset for use
with the PalArch's Journals web site. Please retain
this username and password, as it is necessary for all
work with the journal.

Your username: nuriadi
Password: yyiduZ
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Dear Editor,

Thank you very much for the acceptance my article to
be published in this reputable journal. | am very
pleased to accept this good news.

| will do my best to revise the article as
suggested/recommended. | will send it soon as well
as the payment of its publication.

Sir, | still struggle for finding out any possible solution
to make the previous article directly attached in
google scholar.

And | think this is because | use
nuriadisayip2017@gmail.com as the corresponding
author email previously used in the submission
system.

This 2nd article is also using the same email in the
system.

So, is it possible to attach this second email
nuriadi@unram.ac.id in the system Sir, so as to make
them automatocally attached/seen the Google
Scholar too?

In this cae | am very grateful for your help.

Thank you very much.

Best regards,

Nuriadi

Tampilkan kutipan teks
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Dear Authors
Your paper will be published within 7 days

Regards
Editorial Team

Tampilkan kutipan teks

>>> Editorial Team
>>>

>>>
>>
>

>>> Journal of Archaeology of Egyptology [1]

> [1] https://www.archives.palarch.nl/index.php/jae

Dr. Nuriadi, SS. M.Hum - 19/5/2021
—————————— Forwarded message ---------
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2- There are many grammatical errors

3- Please explain the motivation of the study

4- Please make sure, after corrections your similarity
indexed should be less than 20%

5- APA style of referencing is required

For publication, you need to pay the APC of USD 700.
Please submit your corrected paper and payment via
email "editor@palarch.nl” within 7 days. The account
details are mentioned below.

Regards

Payment Option 1 PayPal Payment COpliond

Method: FayPal
scholar _ecomomist@yahoo.co.uk 3-Malaysia Account:
Clicle om the ink amd make payment in USD + 8% PayPal Bank Account Information in Order to pay the process

= Fee Beneflciary's Name [ntellechaal Edge Consultancy
Payment Oplion 2 SDN Bhd
Contact No. +60-172957400
Indonesan Account (Only for Indonesian Authors): Bank Name Address: AFFIN [SLAMIC BANE
Account Holder: CV Intellectual Edge Consultancy BERHAD, M5U Shah Alam Busness Centre, 2nd Floor
Bank Name CIMB NIAGA Shanah University Drve, Off Persiaran Olahraga 40100 Shah
Branch; Cabang Banjamaun-Ahmad Yam Km 2.5 Alam, Selangor Malaysia
Account Number: 860008 267700 Beneficiary's Accomnt No: 1 06640006258
n SWIFT CODE: AIBEMYEL
SR Beneficiary's Address: B2-1202, TTD] Adina Jalan Judo
1345 Shah Alam 40100 Selangor Malayna

AFFAN 534N

The authors from Irag can contact wath our representative
Mr. Ahamd He wall guide how to transfer Fee from lraq to
Malavsia WhatsApp+964 771851 6362

Maote:l- Please write the Tull “Beneflciary” nawie o therwizse pavment will mei eredil @ the accownl.

2-Please pul the imvoice # asa payment reference

- Paymeni ismot refundable inany case.

;!}Iﬁh IEC isonly responsibhle forpublication and should NOT be vesponsible forany kind ofindexing such as Scopus,
el

Editorial Team

Journal of Archaeology of Egyptology

A Dr Nuriadi SS M Hum - 16/5/2021
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“

Nuriadi Nuriadi:

We have reached a decision regarding your
submission to PalArch's Journal of Archaeology of
Egypt / Egyptology, "AN ALTERNATIVE METHOD OF
TEACHING CREATIVE LITERARY WRITING: A CASE
STUDY OF EFL LEARNERS AT INDONESIAN
UNIVERSITY".

Our decision is to Accept Submission with Minor
Corrections.

Your paper will be published in Volume 18 Issue 03-
2021. The summary of review comments are given
below

1- Please add some recent studies from top journals
in your area

2- There are many grammatical errors

3- Please explain the motivation of the study

4- Please make sure, after corrections your similarity
indexed should be less than 20%

5- APA style of referencing is required
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[JAE] Password Reset
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Kotak Masuk

Editor 14/5/2021
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kepada saya v

We have received a request to reset your password
for the PalArch's Journals web site.

If you did not make this request, please ignore this
email and your password will not be changed. If you
wish to reset your password, click on the below URL.

Reset my password: https://www.archives.palarch.
nl/index.php/jae/login/resetPassword/nuriadi?
confirm=a0dc9bbe602114184828755edb7600
cd955e801dca954c92a9bf50519747
2125%3A1620952533

Editor

Journal of Archaeology of Egyptology

th’hﬂ"‘ e 'I'hic'J'w ( Thank you w (Thﬂrﬂ(c - |n+w
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